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Katariina Salmela-Aro is professor and chair of the Personality 
and Work Psychology Sector, University of Jyväskylä, Finland, 
Department of Psychology. She is also President of the 
European Association for Developmental Psychology, a 
visiting professor at the Institute of Education, University of 
London (UK), and a Research Director at the Cicero Learning 
(Brain, Learning and Education) in the University of Helsinki, 
Finland. Her main interests are motivation, critical life 
transitions, productive development and well-being and related 
interventions. 

 

 

 

Milagros Sáinz, PhD in Social Psychology, is a senior 
researcher at the Internet Interdisciplinary Institute (IN3) of the 
Open University of Catalonia (UOC), where she leads the 
Gender and ICT research group. He is part of the editorial 
team of several international journals and scientific boards 
and an active member of the Consortium for Cross-cultural 
Research on Education and the Gender and STEM Network. 
Her research interests focus on the influence of family and 
school in the choice of studies and careers, the development 
of gender roles during adolescence, the construction of 
gender in professional careers, or the attitudes of teachers 
and students of secondary schools towards technological 
disciplines, from a gender perspective. 


